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From the desk of Byron Burke

I want to thank you for taking time out of your busy schedule to download this copy of
the 2008 Internet Marketing Hot Sheet Vol. 1. There are so many companies that
promote different marketing techniques, it would take years to mention all of them.

In this Hot Sheet, I’ve covered several marketing programs and techniques that I’ve
found to be very successful, in a very short time. You may be aware of some of them,
but at the end of the day, it really depends on the user.

I know that many people have spent hundreds, even thousands of dollars on different
programs and methods to build an online business, or even promote other products and
services. I want to share with you my personal opinion and experience with the
information that you will read shortly, and it may be a great service for you.

On this Hot Sheet, it only shows you some of the programs and methods that I’ve use
and tested over the past 14 months. This report will give you a step-by-step on how to
tie everything together to create an income around $50K - $300K per month within 3-12
months.

The best way to get the most out of this report is to be connecte to the internet. There
are several links in this report that will take to you different websites about videos, books
and software products.

After you finish reading this report, I would like to read your feedback and comments on
our blog .

Click here to post your feedback and comments.

God bless,

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
http://byronburkeshotsheets.blogspot.com/2008/03/welcome-to-byron-burkes-hot-sheets-blog.html
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 10 Disturbing Trends in Subliminal Advertising
By Martin Howard

In whom the god of this world hath blinded the minds of them which believe not, lest the light of the
glorious gospel of Christ, who is the image of God, should shine unto them.

2 Corinthians 4:4

Some of the biggest advertisers are taking their advertising away from full-page ads and
television spots and spending up on hidden persuasion. You won't find these secret
messages in ice-cubes or flickering film footage like they were in the sixties. Subliminal
advertising has gone mainstream - fake news, mind control scripts, propaganda and
stealth voicemail are in wide use by corporations, government bodies, and industry
groups. Have you spotted any of these?

1. Point of Sale Mind Control Scripts
Clothing store staff and car salesmen use them to close the deal - carefully planned
questions and subverbal cues to get you to sign. If you’ve ever walked out of a store,
after spending twice as much as you wanted to, chances are you’ve fallen victim to one
of these scripts. The GAPACT is used by Gap staff to upsell you. Other salesmen use
word techniques to make you buy, even when you don’t have the money - because they
make more by selling you 'easy' finance. When a car salesmen takes you on a test drive
and asks you “Is this the type of vehicle you would like to own?”, he is using a subtle
mental framing trick - it can create an embarrassing distraction while you drive. The
technique is called disassociation - which is the ideal state for mental manipulation.

2. Doctor-Patient Drug Kick-backs
When a doctor recommends a certain heart medication or an antidepressant, chances
are he has been paid a cash bonuses and perks by the manufacturer, making it difficult
to give objective advice. Some pharmaceutical firms have gone so far as to invent and
promote a new syndrome in order to create a market for a new drug! Social Anxiety
Disorder (SAD) was devised in 1998 and publicised by planting fifty press stories and
quizzes such as: “Do you have social anxiety disorder?”. Soon after, Smithkline
Beecham released Paxil - the 'cure' for SAD.

3. In-Store Sensory Manipulation
Scientifically tested visual displays, Muzak tapes, and even mind altering scents
combine to maximize impulse spending. Specially designed music loops can keep
shoppers in the supermarket for 18% longer. One study into use of airborne aromas,
pumped into a Canadian mall, resulted in an increase of over $50 per customer that
week. In supermarkets, scientifically generated Planograms create the ideal shelf
arrangement for certain products, skewing the shopper's eyes towards high value items.
Companies pay slotting allowances for favoured placement. Aisle layout are change
regularly - which prevents systematic shopping - forcing extra trips past the impulse item
displays.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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4. Private Conversation Rental
Positive buzz can be triggered artificially for a price. Marketers now recruit secret 'buzz
agents' to promote to their friends and family. One buzz agency claims to have an army
of agents in every major US city. Their job is to mention or display certain products as
they go about their day, using their relationships as marketing channels. Music labels,
book sellers, entertainment venues, and fashion outlets are using this method to
establish new brands. Today’s billion dollar 12-16 year olds are so immune to traditional
advertising, mass media is no longer a reliable persuasive device - so the alternative is
a 'synthetic grapevine.’

5. Neuromarketing
Corporations are going to enormous lengths to probe the minds of consumers - literally
tapping into their brains. The Brighthouse Institute for Thought Sciences, in Atlanta, is
one lab that is scanning people's brains with MRIs, in an effort to decode and record our
subconscious thoughts and devise more seductive advertising. The process is being
called neuromarketing. They are hoping to determine specific biological triggers that can
be used by language engineers to stimulate purchases. This is the hi-tech fulfilment of
pioneer psychologists Freud and Jung who established the connection between
language and behaviour.

6. Chatbots and Stealth Voicemail
Personal phone messages from businesses or political campaigners can turn up in your
morning voicemail, having been delivered late the previous night. Voicemail
broadcasters like DialAmerica uses massive computer installations to deliver identical
copies of spoken messages to millions of householder simultaneously. On the internet,
chat room 'bots' masquerading as personal real buddies are actually distributed
simultaneously by powerful computers 24 hours a day. Virtual word-of-mouth
communication is replacing other promotional technologies because of its speed and
price.

7. Real-time Bugging of Personal Data
Your browser is probably revealing more than you might want: your location, the
software and hardware you are using, details of other links you clicked on and your
browsing habits. Many third party dataminers use 'cookies' to track your path across the
web. Extensive realtime information is processed to target you. Larger databases
harvest your personal medical and financial records to be bought and sold by interested
companies and government departments. Datamining is a fuzzy science that filters you
personal information for links about your personal behaviour and finances. These details
are used in turn to create elaborate marketing campaigns to sell you more stuff.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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8. Sidewalk Stalkers
The public space of streets, neighborhoods and communities is being mapped and
targeted by viral marketers and fake grassroots organizations. In some cases the
campaigns are overt but, increasingly, street 'agents' are making unannounced social
approaches. Fake tourists flash around the latest camera-phone to passing crowds.
'Product seeders' circulate at sports events to find influential young players to wear their
gear. Others wander the street wearing colored corporate tattoos. Personal space is the
last frontier for commerce. As citizens attempt to retreat from the deluge of media
advertising they can now be stalked when they step out the door.

9. Planted News Stories
Industry front groups, public relations firms and government departments are planting
news stories on TV, radio, newspapers and the web. Those 'miracle drug' stories or
research reports are often Video News Release (VNRs). TV newsrooms love these
prepackaged news items that are distributed across the networks. It saves them time
and money but it is killing community news and genuine investigative reporting. Real
news items are being replaced by slick corporate promotions and political messages.
According to one Nielsen Media Research Survey, about 80 percent of U.S. news
directors air VNRs several times a month, and all American television newsrooms now
use VNRs in their newscasts.

10. Government Propaganda
When it's time to launch a war or promote an unpopular policy, the government needs
special help to sell the idea through the media. Opinion engineers are paid to "manage"
public perception of inconvenient facts, and turn them around for better. Using the
universal tools fear, patriotism, and phrase repetition, these high flying spin doctors can
easily sway the population. The most successful public relations campaigns aim to
change public perception without our awareness of the campaign. They are typically
launched by governments, institutions and countries who need to change their public
image, restore their reputation or manipulate public opinion. There are PR firms today
who advise dictatorships, dishonest politicians and corrupt industries to cover up
environmental catastrophes and human rights violations.

We Know What You Want: How They Change Your Mind

Why We Buy: The Science of Shopping

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
http://lburl.com/mf4fz
http://www.amazon.com/gp/product/0684849143?ie=UTF8&tag=branchrecordi-20&linkCode=as2&camp=1789&creative=9325&creativeASIN=0684849143
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Online Protection from Identity Theft

Internet identity theft, phishing, and on-line financial fraud are increasingly becoming
compelling drivers for deploying strong authentication for consumer applications. As
financial institutions and e-commerce sites launch new initiatives to shore up consumer
confidence in their brands, online banking and transactions, government agencies have
begun to recommend identity protection guidelines. For example, the recent guidance on
Authentication in an Internet Banking Environment (FFIEC-AUTH) issued by the Federal
Financial Institutions Examination Council (FFIEC), recommends that financial
institutions offering Internet-based products and services to their customers should use
effective methods to authenticate the identity of customers using those products and
services. Specifically - the FFIEC-AUTH considers single-factor authentication, as the
only control mechanism, to be inadequate in the case of high-risk transactions involving
access to customer information or the movement of funds to other parties.

Many of the programs that we studied do not met these standards.

Be Careful What You Download. When you download a program or file from an
unknown source, you risk loading malicious software programs on your computer.
Fraudsters often hide these programs within seemingly benign applications. Think
twice before you click on a pop-up advertisement or download a "free" game or
gadget.

Use Your Own Computer. It's generally safer to access your online accounts from
your own computer than from other computers. If you use a computer other than your
own, for example, you won't know if it contains viruses or spyware. If you do use
another computer, be sure to delete all of the your "Temporary Internet Files" and
clear all of your "History" after you log off your account.

Don't Respond to Emails Requesting Personal Information. Legitimate entities
will not ask you to provide or verify sensitive information through a non-secure
means, such as email. If you have reason to believe that an affiliate program actually
does need personal information from you, pick up the phone and call the company
yourself - using the number in your rolodex, not the one the email provides!

Security Tip: Even though a web address in an email may look legitimate, fraudsters
can mask the true destination. Rather than merely clicking on a link provided in an

email, type the web address into your browser yourself (or use a bookmark you
previously created).

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Be Smart About Your Password. The best passwords are ones that are difficult to
guess. Try using a password that consists of a combination of numbers, letters (both
upper case and lower case), punctuation, and special characters. You should change
your password regularly and use a different password for each of your accounts. Don't
share your password with others and never reply to "phishing" emails with your
password or other sensitive information. You also shouldn't store your password on your
computer. If you need to write down your password, store it in a secure, private place.

Use Extra Caution with Wireless Connections. Wireless networks may not
provide as much security as wired Internet connections. In fact, many "hotspots" -
wireless networks in public areas like airports, hotels and restaurants - reduce their
security so it's easier for individuals to access and use these wireless networks.
Unless you use a security token, you may decide that accessing your online
brokerage account through a wireless connection isn't worth the security risk. You
can learn more about security issues relating to wireless networks on the website of
the Wi-Fi Alliance.

Log Out Completely. Closing or minimizing your browser or typing in a new web
address when you're done using your online account may not be enough to prevent
others from gaining access to your account information. Instead, click on the "log out"
button to terminate your online session. In addition, you shouldn't permit your
browser to "remember" your username and password information. If this browser
feature is active, anyone using your computer will have access to your brokerage
account information.

Monitor Your Credit Report. Reviewing your credit report may alert you to
unauthorized activity, and, therefore, can be an effective way to fight identity theft.
You can obtain a copy of your credit reports from the 3 major credit bureaus here.

Recommended Computer Security Company & Books

PGP - Desktop & Laptop Security Encryption Software

How to Be Invisible: The Essential Guide to Protecting Your Personal Privacy,
Your Assets, and Your Life (Revised Edition)

Stop Identity Theft by Suze Orman

Hide My IP Address Software

Safe Proxy list software  & Proxy Information

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
http://www.dpbolvw.net/6n122ox52x4KNNUUOTTKMLPOPUNQ
http://www.jdoqocy.com/click-2299388-10478457
http://www.amazon.com/gp/product/0312319061?ie=UTF8&tag=branchrecordi-20&linkCode=as2&camp=1789&creative=9325&creativeASIN=0312319061
http://www.amazon.com/gp/product/0312319061?ie=UTF8&tag=branchrecordi-20&linkCode=as2&camp=1789&creative=9325&creativeASIN=0312319061
http://www.amazon.com/gp/product/1605300357?ie=UTF8&tag=branchrecordi-20&linkCode=as2&camp=1789&creative=9325&creativeASIN=1605300357
http://lburl.com/kzfzf
http://lburl.com/ff94j
http://proxy.org/
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The Power of Giving – By Anthony Robbins

Whether it's donating to your favorite nonprofit or putting your money into the basket at
church, there are a number of people who make an effort to charitably give something.
As Tony often says, only those who have learned the power of sincere and selfless
contribution experience life's deepest joy: true fulfillment.

But maybe it's time to take that selfless contribution to the next level. One way you might
consider is to tithe, or voluntarily contribute a tenth part of your annual income. Though
giving away 10% of your income may at first seem a bit too selfless, the key is to stop
thinking of it as charity and instead consider it an investment! Tony believes that the
more you grow and contribute, the more energy, strength, power, and insight comes to
you, ultimately making you feel more alive!

Sir John Templeton, billionaire investor and expert contributor to Tony's Life Mastery
program, considered tithing the best investment a person can make, regardless of his or
her financial situation. Sir John himself donated more than a million dollars each year to
those individuals and organizations he believed most improved our understanding of
religion. Tony is also a firm believer that your income is in direct proportion to your
contribution.

Take a few moments to read this discussion Tony once had with Sir John Templeton on
the subject of tithing, and discover what tithing could do for you!

Tony Robbins: How do you resolve the break that so many people have between
spirituality, if I may ask you, and finance, because they go together?

Sir John Templeton: Always start out to give more than you get, to give more than is
expected from you, to treat the other person more than fairly. And that is the secret of
success. Never try to take advantage of anyone, or to hold anyone back in their own
progress. The more you help others, the more prosperous you will be personally.

Tony Robbins: What is your definition of wealth, Sir John?

Sir John Templeton: If I had to choose one investment, Tony, the one that I've never
seen to fail, it is tithing, giving 10% or more of your income to churches and charities. I
have never met or watched anyone who did tithing for 10 years, who did not become
both prosperous and happy. The quality it takes to be a good tither are the same
qualities it takes to be a good business man, to be popular, to be sought after by your
customers.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Tony Robbins: So many people say, "Well, I'll tithe once I have some money." Why
shouldn't someone wait? Why should they start now, even if they're in financial trouble?

Sir John Templeton: It's only an excuse to say that I will begin once I have more money.
It doesn't matter whether your income is small or large, you can be tithing and you can
be a saver. Do not try to be a go-getter, try to be a go-giver.

Tony Robbins: How do we reestablish those ... those values that have created the
quality of life for you and for so many people around the world?

Sir John Templeton: You may not be able to control somebody else's thoughts, or you
may not control the nation, but if you try, you can control your own thoughts. If you fill up
your mind with thoughts of gratitude for your blessings, your whole life will go better,
your health will be better. It'll be reflected in your appearance. People will be drawn to
you. Your business will go better.

Click Here for Anthony Robbins Companies

Anthony Robbins NLP Secret

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
http://lburl.com/vwflt
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The Abrahamic Covenant of Wealth

When it comes to talking about prosperity, especially in the area of money, it strikes a
bad cord with many Christians, including non-Christians. If you read the book of Genesis
chapter 1 and verses 3-28 you will notice all the things that God created first, then They
(The Father, Son & Holy Spirit) created man in their image (verses 26 & 27).

In verses 28 & 29 from the King James Version it says...

Genesis 1:28 And God blessed them, and God said unto them, Be fruitful, and multiply,
and replenish the earth, and subdue it: and have dominion over the fish of the sea, and
over the fowl of the air, and over every living thing that moveth upon the earth.

Genesis 1:29 And God said, Behold, I have given you every herb bearing seed, which is
upon the face of all the earth, and every tree, in the which is the fruit of a tree yielding
seed; to you it shall be for meat.

Genesis 1:30 And to every beast of the earth, and to every fowl of the air, and to every
thing that creepeth upon the earth, wherein there is life, I have given every green herb
for meat: and it was so.

God gave man a charge or a set of rules to be an oversee of the affairs that take place
on earth. When Adam disobeyed the command of God, then through the seed of Adam,
mankind had forfeited its right to have dominion over the earth until Noah.

After several of Noah's generations had passed, then Abram appeared. That's when the
Lord showed up to him and started the next steps of establishing God's restoration plan
for mankind (Genesis 12:1-3).

Let's look at the meaning of the word Covenant:

1 : a usually formal, solemn, and binding agreement : COMPACT

2 a : a written agreement or promise usually under seal between two or more parties
especially for the performance of some action b : the common-law action to recover
damages for breach of such a contract.

If we go the book of Genesis chapter 15, we can see the covenant that the Lord set with
Abram.

Genesis 15:1 After these things the word of the LORD came unto Abram in a vision,
saying, Fear not, Abram: I am thy shield, and thy exceeding great reward.

Genesis 15:2 And Abram said, Lord GOD, what wilt thou give me, seeing I go childless,
and the steward of my house is this Eliezer of Damascus?

Genesis 15:3 And Abram said, Behold, to me thou hast given no seed: and, lo, one born
in my house is mine heir.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Genesis 15:4 And, behold, the word of the LORD came unto him, saying, This shall not
be thine heir; but he that shall come forth out of thine own bowels shall be thine heir.

Genesis 15:5 And he brought him forth abroad, and said, Look now toward heaven, and
tell the stars, if thou be able to number them: and he said unto him, So shall thy seed
be.

Genesis 15:6 And he believed in the LORD; and he counted it to him for righteousness.

Many never see the blessings of the Lord manifest in their lives due to unbelief or
improper teaching in Church. Let's look at a lawyer for a moment. People use lawyers to
help them with contracts and legal matters. Many of them are millionaires and
billionaires, why? They understand the laws of the material realm.

If you read Joshua 1:8, it talks about if you learn the Law (Gods ways of doing things),
you will prosper and have good success. The Pastor of the church is the lawyer of God's
laws and its their job to teach you the law so you will prosper and have good success. If
that pastor learns and follows the Laws of God, including the clients, they both will
prosper, for the word of God says in the book of Romans 2:11...

For there is no respect of persons with God.

If you follow and teach the laws of God, you have no other choice but to prosper. amen

lets continue...

Genesis 15:7 And he said unto him, I am the LORD that brought thee out of Ur of the
Chaldees, to give thee this land to inherit it.

Genesis 15:8 And he said, Lord GOD, whereby shall I know that I shall inherit it?

Genesis 15:9 And he said unto him, Take me an heifer of three years old, and a she
goat of three years old, and a ram of three years old, and a turtledove, and a young
pigeon.

Genesis 15:10 And he took unto him all these, and divided them in the midst, and laid
each piece one against another: but the birds divided he not.

Let me ask you a question... Have you ever gotten the idea to give something to
someone or go somewhere you never been, even tell a total stranger something that
could help them, but you didn't do it? What stopped you? Was it the fear of loss or you
didn't know them?

I don't want to get side tracked, but God has an agreement with humanity to bring forth
an abundant life. The only problem is that many don't know or understand the Laws to
see the blessings manifest in their life. Let's keep going...

Genesis 15:11 And when the fowls came down upon the carcases, Abram drove them
away.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Genesis 15:12 And when the sun was going down, a deep sleep fell upon Abram; and,
lo, an horror of great darkness fell upon him.

Genesis 15:13 And he said unto Abram, Know of a surety that thy seed shall be a
stranger in a land that is not theirs, and shall serve them; and they shall afflict them four
hundred years;

Genesis 15:14 And also that nation, whom they shall serve, will I judge: and afterward
shall they come out with great substance.

Genesis 15:15 And thou shalt go to thy fathers in peace; thou shalt be buried in a good
old age.

Many people have money invested in 401K plans, social security, bonds just to name a
few for their future. If they got an understand of the Covenant of God, they will see that
what God has for them is much more than any world government can provide. Thank
you Jesus!! Moving on again..

Genesis 15:16 But in the fourth generation they shall come hither again: for the iniquity
of the Amorites is not yet full.

Genesis 15:17 And it came to pass, that, when the sun went down, and it was dark,
behold a smoking furnace, and a burning lamp that passed between those pieces.

Genesis 15:18 In the same day the LORD made a covenant with Abram, saying, Unto
thy seed have I given this land, from the river of Egypt unto the great river, the river
Euphrates:

Looking at verse 18, you can see that made something and gave something. God is a
creates and gives. That's one of the Laws that God has established. For it is written in
the book of Luke from the Amplified Bible...

Luke 6:38 Give, and [gifts] will be given to you; good measure, pressed down, shaken
together, and running over, will they pour into [the pouch formed by] the bosom [of your
robe and used as a bag]. For with the measure you deal out [with the measure you use
when you confer benefits on others], it will be measured back to you.

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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The Passion Movie

Just think about the Mel Gibson movie "The Passion". Mr. Gibson sowed or invested
$34 million dollars of his money into creating that movie for God's Kingdom Business.

Not only did that movie touch the hearts of millions of people around the world; hundreds
of thousands, even millions gave their life to Jesus and returned to Church.

Giving into the Kingdom of God is making and investment, not something that is going to
be taken away from you.

The problems is that the education system doesn't teach you about investing into
spiritual things, they teach you how to invest into material things. There are many
millionaires and billionaires that have and will read this document that are depressed
because of that next major deal. After they get the deal, there is still something missing.

Let me ask you this.... What fortune 500 company has been around longer than the
word of God?

When you invest into the Kingdom of God, He will raise you up as a fortune 500
company with a peace of mind and a business that you can pass on to generations in
your family line for years to come. Amen

Let's do some quick math on what Mel Gibson did based upon an investment scripture
in the book of

Luke 8:11 Now the parable is this: The seed is the word of God.

In order for a seed to grow, it must be planted into the ground. When it comes to God's
seed, it must be planted into the hearts of man.

Mel Gibson took the seed of God's word and created the Passion movie. The word was
planted into the people that viewed the movie.

Now watch this....

Luke 8:12 Those by the way side are they that hear; then cometh the devil, and taketh
away the word out of their hearts, lest they should believe and be saved.

There were many people that were manipulated by Satanic power to put the movie down
because of the graphic content. I find that quite strange due to the fact that just about
every 3-6 weeks there is a horror film coming out of Hollywood with people dying, losing
limbs, and the video game industry. (this should push some buttons)

THE KINGDOM OF GOD INVESTMENTS

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Matthew 13:23 But he that received seed into the good ground is he that heareth the
word, and understandeth it; which also beareth fruit, and bringeth forth, some an
hundredfold, some sixty, some thirty.

Let's look at it like this..

The Abrahamic Covenant Fund Laws of ROI (Return on Investment)

Law 1. You love God first and do as the Lord instructs. (Deuteronomy 6:5-7 & Genesis
12:1-3 - Amplified Bible)

Deuteronomy 6:5 And thou shalt love the LORD thy God with all thine heart, and with all
thy soul, and with all thy might.

Deuteronomy 6:6 And these words, which I command thee this day, shall be in thine
heart:

Deuteronomy 6:7 And thou shalt teach them diligently unto thy children, and shalt talk of
them when thou sittest in thine house, and when thou walkest by the way, and when
thou liest down, and when thou risest up.

Genesis 12:1 NOW [in Haran] the Lord said to Abram, Go for yourself [for your own
advantage] away from your country, from your relatives and your father's house, to the
land that I will show you.

Genesis 12:2 And I will make of you a great nation, and I will bless you [with abundant
increase of favors] and make your name famous {and} distinguished, and you will be a
blessing [dispensing good to others].

Genesis 12:3 And I will bless those who bless you [who confer prosperity or happiness
upon you] and curse him who curses {or} uses insolent language toward you; in you will
all the families {and} kindred of the earth be blessed [and by you they will bless
themselves].

Have you ever said any thing to offend someone that God has blessed? Many business
have failed due to greed, bitterness, unforgivness and trying to please others.

Law 2. When you give into an anointed ministry, that Man of Woman of God must bless
you (give you and endowment with power) for your Kingdom investment. (Genesis
14:18-23 - Amplified Bible)

Genesis 14:18 Melchizedek king of Salem [later called Jerusalem] brought out bread
and wine [for their nourishment]; he was the priest of God Most High,

Genesis 14:19 And he blessed him and said, Blessed (favored with blessings, made
blissful, joyful) be Abram by God Most High, Possessor {and} Maker of heaven and
earth,

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Genesis 14:20 And blessed, praised, {and} glorified be God Most High, Who has given
your foes into your hand! And [Abram] gave him a tenth of all [he had taken].

Genesis 14:21 And the king of Sodom said to Abram, Give me the persons and keep
the goods for yourself.

Genesis 14:22 But Abram said to the king of Sodom, I have lifted up my hand {and}
sworn to the Lord, God Most High, the Possessor {and} Maker of heaven and earth,

Genesis 14:23 That I would not take a thread or a shoelace or anything that is yours,
lest you should say, I have made Abram rich.

What your investment will be used for:

Saving souls

Teaching and training disciples for Christ (to raise the dead, cast out demons
and heal the sick)

Outreach Ministry Programs

Creating Schools

Hospitals

Television programs

Jobs & Start-up business development programs

Crusades

Banking

Real Estate

Feeding the Homeless

Creating shelters for Orphans and schools

I've found it quite interesting that many savvy investors put their money into companies
hoping to get an return on their investments and have no idea what happens to the
money after they make the transaction. Just think about that for a moment. How many
times have you given money to someone for a certain cause, then you find out that it
was used for something else?

Law 3. When you are called by God to do or give something close to your heart, He is
going to give your more that what you asked for. Let's look at what God did for Mel

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Gibson.

Investor: Mel Gibson - The Passion of Christ Movie

Production Budget / Investment: $35 million

Now when you invest in the Kingdom of God like Mel Gibson did with the Passion
Movie, this is what happened.

10% of $35 M = $350K

Offering  $34.6 M (anything over the 10% moves into the offering section)

Worldwide Sales: $611,899,420 and counting!

Let do some deductions…

Wait one minute… I’m not going to do what I had planned to do, I’m going to do
something better… Let’s look at the company that did the distribution for The Passion.

Newmarket Films biggest movie distribution before The Passion was this movie called
“Monsters”, and they grossed $34,469,210. They were the only company that was willing
to distribute The Passion Movie, and their gross earnings for that was a whopping
$370,782,930!

Remember Genesis 12:2

Genesis 12:2 And I will make of you a great nation, and I will bless you [with abundant
increase of favors] and make your name famous {and} distinguished, and you will be a
blessing [dispensing good to others].

Mel Gibson had a hard time trying to find a studio that would produce the movie, but
God gave him favor; His name is famous and distinguished and Newmarket Films
distributed the good!

What type of investment program can give you that type of return? You don't need a
GED to figure that out? Amen!

For it is written in the book of Joshua 1:8 & Mark 10:29 & 30 from the Amplified Bible...

Joshua 1:8 This Book of the Law shall not depart out of your mouth, but you shall
meditate on it day and night, that you may observe {and} do according to all that is
written in it. For then you shall make your way prosperous, and then you shall deal
wisely {and} have good success.

Mark 10:29 Jesus said, Truly I tell you, there is no one who has given up {and} left
house or brothers or sisters or mother or father or children or lands for My sake and for
the Gospel's

Mark 10:30 Who will not receive a hundred times as much now in this time--houses
and brothers and sisters and mothers and children and lands, with persecutions--and in

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
http://www.the-numbers.com/movies/2004/PASON.php


Internet Marketing Hot Sheet 2008 Vol. 1

Copyright 2008, Internet Marketing Millions Page 19

the age to come, eternal life.

As you all know, Mel Gibson got persecuted for making the Passion movie, but by doing
that movie, God gave blessed Him just like Abraham for going into Egypt in the book of
Genesis 12:11-20: 13:1, for it is written..

Genesis 12:11 And when he was about to enter into Egypt, he said to Sarai his wife, I
know that you are beautiful to behold.

Genesis 12:12 So when the Egyptians see you, they will say, This is his wife; and they
will kill me, but they will let you live.

Genesis 12:13 Say, I beg of you, that you are my sister, so that it may go well with me
for your sake and my life will be spared because of you.

Genesis 12:14 And when Abram came into Egypt, the Egyptians saw that the woman
was very beautiful.

Genesis 12:15 The princes of Pharaoh also saw her and commended her to Pharaoh,
and she was taken into Pharaoh's house [harem].

Genesis 12:16 And he treated Abram well for her sake; he acquired sheep, oxen,
he-donkeys, menservants, maidservants, she-donkeys, and camels.

Genesis 12:17 But the Lord scourged Pharaoh and his household with serious plagues
because of Sarai, Abram's wife.

Genesis 12:18 And Pharaoh called Abram and said, What is this that you have done to
me? Why did you not tell me that she was your wife?

Genesis 12:19 Why did you say, She is my sister, so that I took her to be my wife? Now
then, here is your wife; take her and get away [from here]!

Genesis 12:20 And Pharaoh commanded his men concerning him, and they brought him
on his way with his wife and all that he had.

Genesis 13:1 SO ABRAM went up out of Egypt, he and his wife and all that he had, and
Lot with him, into the South [country of Judah, the Negeb].

Genesis 13:2 Now Abram was extremely rich in livestock and in silver and in gold.

Why did Abram come out of Egypt rich? He did as the Lord instructed. He was walking
by the spirit (the voice or the word) of the Lord and not by sight.

Deuteronomy 8:6 Therefore thou shalt keep the commandments of the LORD thy God,
to walk in his ways, and to fear him.

Deuteronomy 8:7 For the LORD thy God bringeth thee into a good land, a land of brooks
of water, of fountains and depths that spring out of valleys and hills;

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Deuteronomy 8:8 A land of wheat, and barley, and vines, and fig trees, and
pomegranates; a land of oil olive, and honey;

Deuteronomy 8:9 A land wherein thou shalt eat bread without scarceness, thou shalt not
lack any thing in it; a land whose stones are iron, and out of whose hills thou mayest dig
brass.

Deuteronomy 8:10 When thou hast eaten and art full, then thou shalt bless the LORD
thy God for the good land which he hath given thee.

Deuteronomy 8:11 Beware that thou forget not the LORD thy God, in not keeping his
commandments, and his judgments, and his statutes, which I command thee this day:

Deuteronomy 8:12 Lest when thou hast eaten and art full, and hast built goodly houses,
and dwelt therein;

Deuteronomy 8:13 And when thy herds and thy flocks multiply, and thy silver and thy
gold is multiplied, and all that thou hast is multiplied;

Deuteronomy 8:14 Then thine heart be lifted up, and thou forget the LORD thy God,
which brought thee forth out of the land of Egypt, from the house of bondage;

Deuteronomy 8:15 Who led thee through that great and terrible wilderness, wherein
were fiery serpents, and scorpions, and drought, where there was no water; who
brought thee forth water out of the rock of flint;

Deuteronomy 8:16 Who fed thee in the wilderness with manna, which thy fathers knew
not, that he might humble thee, and that he might prove thee, to do thee good at thy
latter end;

Deuteronomy 8:17 And thou say in thine heart, My power and the might of mine hand
hath gotten me this wealth.

Deuteronomy 8:18 But thou shalt remember the LORD thy God: for it is he that giveth
thee power to get wealth, that he may establish his covenant which he sware unto thy
fathers, as it is this day.

Deuteronomy 8:19 And it shall be, if thou do at all forget the LORD thy God, and walk
after other gods, and serve them, and worship them, I testify against you this day that ye
shall surely perish.

Deuteronomy 28:1 IF YOU will listen diligently to the voice of the Lord your God, being
watchful to do all His commandments which I command you this day, the Lord your God
will set you high above all the nations of the earth.

Deuteronomy 28:2 And all these blessings shall come upon you and overtake you if you
heed the voice of the Lord your God. Amen

http://www.internetmarketingmillions.page.tl/
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Marketing Tools For Your Buisness

I have tons of different websites, blogs and affiliate programs that I've partnered with
over the past year. At times, I forgot my password & user ID for their site. Its quite a
headache to wait for the company to respond back to you regarding your log in
information. I found a awesome program called "Roboform" that stores all your
passwords, and it can create special passwords for you as well. You can download a
copy of Roboform here.

Creating Videos

   

This is a software program that many top marketing guru's use to create their videos
online. You can check out a sample video of how this works if you click the play button
on the picture above. Also, you can try out a demo version of this program at the same
site.

Video Blaster Pro
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Creating Landing & Squeezes Pages

One of the major things that every business needs are existing and new clients. without
them, your business will fall. But more importantly, you want to keep in touch with your
current members or potential leads about your current and future products and services.

If you created a landing page 1. (Click here for more information), you will get the visitors
information, before you give them the meat of what your project is about. Your Landing
Page should have enough information to grab their attention, and lead them to register
to find out more information.

On Landing page 2, you ask them to refer 3 people (that will build your contact list)
before you take them to your main website. (Watch this video)

Jerry West has some great tips on how you can build an effective landing page (click
here)
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Giving Away Free Products

When you set up your Landing Page or Auto responder, you should have a Free
E-Book or Software Program that your visitors can download after they register. Its a
great way to build your list, and if they decide not to participate fully in your offer,
mention in your e-book to share this information with their friends.

If you don't have a e-book to give away, I recommend the following e-books:

The Maven Matrix Manifesto & The Black Book Authority (Free PDF Download)

If you don't have these e-books, get them before its too late! There's a ton of information
in these e-books that will blow you away! It would be best that you join their affiliate
program so you can add some of their products for your selling arsenal and generate
some major cash.

Click here to join The Maven Matrix Manifesto & The Black Book Authority Affiliate
Programs.

These are two great e-book that will assist you on getting the word out about your
project. Also when you check out the Maven Matrix Manifesto, pay attention to how they
have their Landing pages set up.

This is a great site that allows you to brand your own e-books and build a huge down
line. The amazing thing about this is that, you just have to add your affiliate links,
download the file and send it to a couple of your friends, and watch your money come in
on autopilot!

Viral EBook

Viral Url

One of the major things that happens to new online marketers is that smarter ( in fact,
they are very simple minded) marketers steal others links and commision by copying the
uninformed nubie's affiliate link, and steals their commissions! This will take care of that
problem. Remember to always convert your links from sneaky marketers! Click the link
below to watch a video about Viral Url.

Viral Url
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How To Create An Affiliate Program

If you have down loadable products to sell and you want others to promote them, then
here are three companies that will do the job.

1 Shopping Cart (Sign up today and get a 30 day free trial)
This is by far the number one choice for marketers today. Instantly automate your email
marketing, Website sales, digital delivery, ad tracking, credit card processing, recurring
billing, affiliate program, or any e-commerce activity you want all in one place.

Pay Dot Com
Click Bank
Internet Marketing Millions
E Junkie

Also, there is a new FREE marketplace to sell any product you want or become you can
become an affiliate for any item in their huge marketplace.

Create Images For Your Website
 If you would like to create stunning 3D images for your website or products, check out:

Xara 3D 6

You can get a 15 day free trial for this program.
If you have pictures that you would like to use, but you want to change the background,
get this program called:

Bling it

You can get a 15 day free trial for this program.

Creating & Generating Leads
Here's a couple of ways you can create leads to your site:

Rent-A-List
List Building Power (If you want to lean how to build your list, this is a great
program to use)
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RSS Feeds & Search Submission

RSS Submit is the most powerful RSS feed management and promotion tool available.
The first of its kind for automatically submitting RSS feeds, it is the quickest and most
reliable way to submit to the RSS search engines.

Compatible with Windows 95/98/ME/NT/2000/XP/Vista.

RSS Submit uses a combined method of automatic submissions and auto-filling web
page submit forms to automate the process of submitting your RSS feeds, publishing
your content, and getting more traffic with proven results.

RSS Submit is extremely easy to use. Automatic RSS feed detection allows you to enter
the domain of your web site and let RSS Submit find the locations of your feeds.
Integration with FeedBurner and Technorati statistics lets you track hits to your RSS
feeds right from within the software. RSS Preview and keyword analysis lets you
manage your feeds in real-time.

RSS Feed Software

My Easy Submitter - Search Engine Submission

Feedblitz - Free RSS Feed

Marketing Education Videos

Everyone can enjoy the benefits of MyMarketingTV. It doesn't matter if your a "newbie"
with little or no experience or an advanced internet marketer. MyMarketingTV was built
with everyone in mind especially those who need a little extra help learning how to grow
a successful home based business using the internet!

My MarketingTV
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Create Your Own E Books

Professional eBook Creator

Professional e Book Creator e Writer Pro

 Viral PDF

Rebrands encrypted PDF eBooks

Embeds your eBook in the Rebrander (all except Classic Edition)

Runs from a compact 300kb Rebrander file

Rebrands Hyperlinks and plain-text Urls

Rebrands Embedded Fonts and Font Glyphs

Works with foreign character sets

Embeds your affiliate id in each Rebrander automatically

Viral PDF Locker

This state-of-the-art program runs on your local computer and is a very easy to use and
powerful Windows application that allows you to encrypt (using standard 128-bit RC4
encryption that is supported by Acrobat Reader 3.0 and up) and decrypt existing PDF
documents as well as set printing, changing and copying permissions and add user and
owner passwords.
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Web Hosting
There are several web hosting companies that offer great incentives for building your
website.

I X Web Hosting

   

Kiosk.com

This is one of the top affiliate program hosting sites. You can get a 30 day trial for $1.
Try it today.

Vision Gate Portal

VisionGate gives you everything you need to build, manage , and grow your very own
online membership-based, subscription web site without spending thousands of dollars
hiring programmers to perform research, truing to build everything from scratch or taking
months, even years to launch.

Free Online File Sharing

Drag & drop, super fast, FTP Share photos, files & folders. Group Sharing and
sub-accounts.

Free Online File Sharing
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Social Network Software

CL Auto Poster

Craigslist is a hot bed for marketing your business and exposing your products and
services for free. This software, when used properly and responsibly, will help you
achieve your marketing goals and GREATLY minimize your posting time.  You can
manage and post all of your campaigns from one central location!

Automate your personal and business advertising! The CL Auto Poster makes the
difficult Craigslist posting process child's play and helps you manage and multi-post your
ads.

GREAT FOR: Marketers, Businesses, Auto Dealers, Real Estate Professionals, and
anyone wanting to maximize their exposure, market their products and services on
Craigslist.  Unlike most Craigslist posters that simply do not work, this software is
continually tested and updated for over TWO YEARS! We offer a fully working demo to
show you how effective the CL Auto Poster is.

Craig List Auto Poster (Buy Now)

Craig List Auto Poster (Free Trial)

Black Planet, Facebook, Friendster, Mignate, MySpace, & YouTube Friend
Bomber Software

These are the best social networking software products on today’s market. I’ve been
using these programs for about 4 months, and the results have been outstanding. You
can get a free trial of each of these program right now (except Black Planet).

Get your downloads here
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Wholesale Conference Calls

Click here to find out more about this service.

Clickatell

* A range of API interface options to ensure you can connect easily to their global
messaging gateway.

    * Web-based and PC installed applications for managing contacts and sending SMS
messages at the click of a button.

    * Wholesale and white label solutions for network operators and resellers.

    * High-value services, such as two-way and premium rate messaging.

    * A multimode application, enabling mission-critical messaging across multiple
devices and communication channels, satisfying the needs of large corporate
businesses and government.

Click the link below for more information about Clickatell.

Clickatell
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Grand Central

This is a great free service that you can use to setup your voicemail created my Google.
You can have your calls forward to your home or cell phone, including e-mail alerts when
a new call comes in. There are to many other features to mention in this report, so check
out the site!

Grand Central

Delivery Monitor

Deliverymonitor.com enables an opt-in email senders to track their campaign delivery to
the world's top ISP's automatically. Statistics are calculated showing the percentage of
email arriving in a users inbox, bulk box, or go entirely missing. This is accomplished by
the mailing list owner seeding their existing subscriber list with email addresses located
at top ISP's. When a newsletter is sent, the seed addresses are also sent a copy of the
issue. We are then able to check those mailboxes and create a detailed delivery report
of the newsletter.

Delivery Monitor
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Software Developers / Programmers
If you have an idea for a software program that you want created, you can use the
following companies to help you make your idea a reality.

Rent A Coder

Just post your program or problem here and coders from around the world will email you
bids on doing the work. You can review each bidder's resume and reputation online, and
when you're ready to make your decision, you can rent your personal, expert, coder with
just a few clicks! Its that simple!

Marketing Product Reviews

Marketing Products Review
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Internet Marketing Hot Sheet Report Affiliate Program

I hope you enjoyed this report and I would like to encourage to you share this report with
your friends and family. But more importantly, I would like to pay you for spreading the
word about this report.

If you feel like you’re a person that doesn’t have any selling skills, let me help you ease
your fears.

Has anyone asked you where a particular store or restaurant was at? If you ever
encountered that, then you are a great sells person.

The only problem is that you didn’t get paid for making that referral or giving directions.

Sign up today as an affiliate of the Internet Marketing Hot
Sheet Report and earn 75% of each purchase from the people

that you refer to the Internet Marketing Hot Sheet Report.

Join one of the following affiliate programs for the
Hot Sheet Report:

PayDot.Com

E Junkies
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